
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
PRESS RELEASE 

 

LeasePlan publishes 2020 Annual Report  
 
Amsterdam, 18 March 2021 – LeasePlan Corporation N.V. today publishes its 2020 Annual 
Report. The online 2020 Annual Report can be viewed here. 
  
Featuring market insights, infographics and videos, LeasePlan’s 2020 Annual Report provides 
detailed information on the company’s financial performance in 2020, as well as highlights 
from our sustainability strategy to achieve net zero emissions from our funded fleet by 2030.  
  
Commenting on LeasePlan’s performance in 2020, CEO Tex Gunning said: 
  
“LeasePlan finished one of the most difficult years in living memory in line with the plans we set out at 
the beginning of the crisis, proving again the resilience of our business model and delivering a solid 
underlying net result of EUR 406 million. Looking back, we are very grateful to our customers for their 
loyalty in these exceptional times, and are very proud of all LeasePlanners across the world for their 
competence, dedication and commitment to our business while working from home since March 2020. 
Despite the unprecedented circumstances, LeasePlan didn’t stand still: we made significant 
investments in our digital business model and CarNext.com, and delivered the greenest year in our 
history, with new orders for EVs and plug-in hybrids doubling to 16.5% of all our new orders as of Q4 
2020. Going forward, we are not only confident in our ability to withstand any further market 
disruptions due to the fundamental resilience of our business, but are also excited about the future as 
we transform to a digital business model and capture the many growth opportunities we see ahead.” 
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About LeasePlan  
LeasePlan is a leader in two large and growing markets: Car-as-a-Service for new cars, through its 
LeasePlan business, and the high-quality three-to-four year old used car market, through its 
CarNext.com business. LeasePlan’s Car-as-a-Service business purchases, funds and manages new 
vehicles for its customers, providing a complete end-to-end service for a typical contract duration of 
three to four years. CarNext.com is a pan-European digital marketplace for high-quality used cars 
seamlessly delivering any car, anytime, anywhere and is supplied with vehicles from LeasePlan’s own 
fleet as well as third-party partners. LeasePlan has approximately 1.9 million vehicles under 
management in over 30 countries. With over 50 years’ experience, LeasePlan's mission is to provide 
what’s next in sustainable mobility so our customers can focus on what's next for them. Find out more 
at www.leaseplan.com/corporate. 
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